eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://whbtenders.gov.ir/ni cgep/app?component=$DirectLink& page=Publ...

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

G
"% WESt Bengai Tender Details

AV

m ienders Date : 19-Jun-2018 12:41 PM
& Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN| |WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION
Tender Reference
Number WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19
Tender ID 2018 CE2_177164 1
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency No
Allowed For Fee
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online  |[SNo [Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |/, ICICI BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT-4
/Technical
.pdf 2911 j
.pdf FORMS
.pdf BAR CHART
2 Finance Xls BOQ
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE

2 CERTIFICATES

GST Registration Certificate

GST Registration Certificate

3 COMPANY DETAILS

COMPANY DETAILS 1

PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
MOA, TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES
7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
8 FINANCIAL INFO 2015-16 2015-16
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
0 FINANCIAL INFO 2016-2017 2016-2017
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
10 FINANCIAL INFO 2017-18 2017-18
EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ¥ 38,894 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes
EMD Fee Type percentage |EMD Percentage 2.0%

lof3 19/06/2018 12:41 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

20f3

EMD Payable To

EE-II,
LDCD

https://whbtenders.gov.irVni cgep/app?component=3DirectLink& page=Publ ...

‘ EMD Payable At

ONLINE PAYMENT/ NEFT/

RTGS

Work /Item(s)

Title

WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19/ SL-1

Work Description

Repairs to slope pitching Top Slope wall concreting at Jhumjhumi Bhanga Bundh on Rup-left embankment for a
length of 1200.00 M in Block Shyampur-II under Kultapara Irrigation Section of Seijberia Irrigation Sub-Division

under Lower Damodar Construc

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents.

Independent External |NA

Monitor

Tender Value in ¥ 19,44,701 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA

WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |30

Location in Block Shyampur-II under |Pincode 711301 Pre Bid Meeting Place [NA
Kultapara

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place O/0 EE-II

Address LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 19-Jun-2018 01:00 PM Bid Opening Date 03-Jul-2018 11:00 AM
Document Download / Sale Start |19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM
Date Date

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA

Bid Submission Start Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Tender Documents

NIT .

Document S.No|Document Name Description I()igc;Bn;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT-4 324.47

Work Item

Documents .
S.No |Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c:Bm)ent Size
1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911 i 346.76
2 Tender Documents Bar_Chart_SI1.pdf BAR CHART 46.68
3 BOQ BOQ_317466.xls BOQ 285.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sewcliwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH NAYANJYOTI GHOSH

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA
3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

EE-II, LDCD

Address

Office of the Executive Engineers Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

19/06/2018 12:41 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

30f3

https://whbtenders.gov.irVni cgep/app?component=3DirectLink& page=Publ ...

Tender Creator Details

Created By

ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation

EE

Created Date

19-Jun-2018 12:06 PM

19/06/2018 12:41 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://whbtenders.gov.ir/ni cgep/app?component=$DirectLink& page=Publ...

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

G
"% WESt Bengai Tender Details

AV

m ienders Date : 19-Jun-2018 12:42 PM
& Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN| |WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION
Tender Reference
Number WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19
Tender ID 2018 CE2_177164 2
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency No
Allowed For Fee
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online  |[SNo [Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |/, ICICI BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT-4
/Technical
.pdf 2911 j
.pdf FORMS
.pdf BAR CHART
2 Finance Xls BOQ
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE

2 CERTIFICATES

GST Registration Certificate

GST Registration Certificate

3 COMPANY DETAILS

COMPANY DETAILS 1

PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
MOA, TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES
7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
8 FINANCIAL INFO 2015-16 2015-16
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
0 FINANCIAL INFO 2016-2017 2016-2017
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
10 FINANCIAL INFO 2017-18 2017-18
EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ¥ 37,897 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes
EMD Fee Type percentage |EMD Percentage 2.0%

lof3 19/06/2018 12:42 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
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EMD Payable To

LDCD

https://whbtenders.gov.irVni cgep/app?component=3DirectLink& page=Publ ...

ONLINE PAYMENT/ NEFT/
RTGS

‘ EE-II,

‘ EMD Payable At

Work /Item(s)

Title

WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19/ SL-2

Work Description

Downstream protection of Nimtala Sluice Gate on left embankment of M.M.C. (Reach-VII) in Block Bagnan-II

of Seijberia Irrigation Sub-Division under Lower Damodar Construction Division

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents.

Independent External |NA

Monitor

Tender Value in ¥ 18,94,856 Product Category CIVIL WORKS |Sub category NA

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) (30

Location Nimtala Sluice Gate |Pincode 711317 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place O/0 EE-II LDCD
Address

Critical Dates

Publish Date 19-Jun-2018 01:00 PM Bid Opening Date 03-Jul-2018 11:00 AM
Document Download / Sale Start |19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM
Date Date

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA

Bid Submission Start Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Tender D men

NIT .

Document S.No|Document Name Description I()i:cll(JBn;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT-4 324.47,

Work Item

Documents :
S.No |Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c;Bn;ent Size
1 Tender Documents 2911_j.pdf 2911 i 346.76

Tender Documents Bar_Chart_SI2.pdf BAR CHART 46.37

3 BOQ BOQ_317470.xls BOQ 294.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sewcliwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH NAYANJYOTI GHOSH

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA
3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

EE-II, LDCD

Address

Office of the Executive Engineers Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By

ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation

EE

Created Date

19-Jun-2018 12:12 PM

19/06/2018 12:42 PM
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Tender Details

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Rk
%&‘ West Bengal

m ienders Date : 19-Jun-2018 12:42 PM
& Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN| |WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION
Tender Reference
Number WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19
Tender ID 2018 CE2_177164 3
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency No
Allowed For Fee
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online  |[SNo [Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |/, ICICI BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT-4
/Technical
.pdf 2911 j
.pdf FORMS
.pdf BAR CHART
2 Finance Xls BOQ
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
3 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA, TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES
7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
8 FINANCIAL INFO 201516 2015-16
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
° FINANCIAL INFO 2016-2017 2016-2017
10 FINANCIAL INFO P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET

2017-18

2017-18

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ¥

36,559
percentage |EMD Percentage 2.0%

EMD Exemption Allowed Yes

EMD Fee Type

lof3 19/06/2018 12:42 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

20f3

EMD Payable To ‘ EE-II,

LDCD

https://whbtenders.gov.irVni cgep/app?component=3DirectLink& page=Publ ...

‘ EMD Payable At

ONLINE PAYMENT/ NEFT/
RTGS

Work /Item(s)

Title

WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19/ SL-3

Work Description

Repairs to slope pitching between D.V.C.Tower and Dilalpur Sluice on Rup-left embankment in Block Bagnan-II
under Kultapara Section of Seijberia Irrigation Sub-Division under Lower Damodar Construction Division

Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents.

Details

Independent External |NA

Monitor

Tender Value in ¥ 18,27,970 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA

WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) (30

Location Kultapara Section of Seijberia Pincode 711303 |Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
Irrigation Sub-Divi

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place O/0 EE-II

Address LDCD

Critical Dates

Publish Date 19-Jun-2018 01:00 PM Bid Opening Date 03-Jul-2018 11:00 AM
Document Download / Sale Start |19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM
Date Date

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA

Bid Submission Start Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Tender Documents

NIT .

Document S.No|Document Name Description I()igc::;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT-4 324.47,

Work Item

Documents .
S.No |Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c::;ent Size
1 Tender Documents 2911_i.pdf 2911 i 346.76
2 Tender Documents Bar_Chart_SI3.pdf BAR CHART 46.11
3 BOQ BOQ_317474.xls BOQ 287.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sewcliwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH NAYANJYOTI GHOSH

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA
3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

EE-II, LDCD

Address

Office of the Executive Engineers Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By

ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation

EE

19/06/2018 12:42 PM
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| Created Date | 19-Jun-2018 12:17 PM |

30f3 19/06/2018 12:42 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://whbtenders.gov.ir/ni cgep/app?component=$DirectLink& page=Publ...

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

G
"% WESt Bengai Tender Details

AV

O] ienaers Date : 19-Jun-2018 12:43 PM
& Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN| |WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION
Tender Reference
Number WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19
Tender ID 2018 CE2_177164 4
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency No
Allowed For Fee
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online  |[SNo [Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |/, ICICI BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT-4
/Technical
.pdf 2911 j
.pdf FORMS
.pdf BAR CHART
2 Finance Xls BOQ
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE

2 CERTIFICATES

GST Registration Certificate

GST Registration Certificate

3 COMPANY DETAILS

COMPANY DETAILS 1

PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
MOA, TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES
7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
8 FINANCIAL INFO 2015-16 2015-16
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
0 FINANCIAL INFO 2016-2017 2016-2017
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
10 FINANCIAL INFO 2017-18 2017-18
EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ¥ 20,746 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes
EMD Fee Type percentage |EMD Percentage 2.0%

lof3 19/06/2018 12:43 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

20f3

EMD Payable To

EE-II,
LDCD

https://whbtenders.gov.irVni cgep/app?component=3DirectLink& page=Publ ...

‘ EMD Payable At

ONLINE PAYMENT/ NEFT/

RTGS

Work /Item(s)

Title

WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19/ SL-4

Work Description

Reconstruction of Wooden Bridge over Gaighata Khal at Tekhala at 8.50 Km of S.C.D.C. Amta-II Block,
Dist-Howrah under L.D.C.Division

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents.

Independent External |NA

Monitor

Tender Value in ¥ 10,37,289 Product Category CIVIL WORKS  |Sub category NA

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) (30

Location Gaighata Khal |Pincode 712408 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place O/0O EE-II LDCD
Address

Critical Dates

Publish Date

19-Jun-2018 01:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

03-Jul-2018 11:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End

Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Tender D men

NIT .

Document S.No|Document Name Description I()i:cll(JBn;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT-4 324.47,

Work Item

Documents :
S.No |Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c;Bn;ent Size
1 Tender Documents 2911_j.pdf 2911 i 346.76

Tender Documents Bar_Chart_SI4.pdf BAR CHART 45.97

3 BOQ BOQ_317475.xls BOQ 297.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sewcliwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH NAYANJYOTI GHOSH

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA
3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

EE-II, LDCD

Address

Office of the Executive Engineers Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By

ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation

EE

Created Date

19-Jun-2018 12:22 PM

19/06/2018 12:43 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

G
"% WESt Bengai Tender Details

AV

m ienders Date : 19-Jun-2018 12:43 PM
& Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN| |WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION
Tender Reference
Number WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19
Tender ID 2018 CE2_177164 5
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency No
Allowed For Fee
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online  |[SNo [Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |/, ICICI BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT-4
/Technical
.pdf 2911 j
.pdf FORMS
.pdf BAR CHART
2 Finance Xls BOQ
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE

2 CERTIFICATES

GST Registration Certificate

GST Registration Certificate

3 COMPANY DETAILS

COMPANY DETAILS 1

PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
MOA, TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES
7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
8 FINANCIAL INFO 2015-16 2015-16
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
0 FINANCIAL INFO 2016-2017 2016-2017
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
10 FINANCIAL INFO 2017-18 2017-18
EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ¥ 86,977 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes
EMD Fee Type percentage |EMD Percentage 2.0%

lof3 19/06/2018 12:43 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

20f3

EMD Payable To

https://whbtenders.gov.irVni cgep/app?component=3DirectLink& page=Publ ...

EE-II,
LDCD

‘ EMD Payable At

ONLINE PAYMENT/ NEFT/

RTGS

Work /Item(s)

Title

WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19/ SL-5

Work Description

Protection work along the Right Embankment of Gaighata khal for a length of 135 m from single vent sluice to
house of Gopal Sing in G.P-Khalna, Block- Amta-II, P.S.-Joypur, Dist-Howrah

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents.

Independent External |NA

Monitor

Tender Value in ¥ 43,48,870 Product Category CIVIL WORKS  |Sub category NA

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) (60

Location Gaighata Khal |Pincode 711303 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place O/O EE-II LDCD
Address

Critical Dates

Publish Date

19-Jun-2018 01:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

03-Jul-2018 11:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM

Document Download / Sale End
Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Clarification Start Date

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Tender D men

NIT :

Document S.No|Document Name Description I()i:cll(JBn;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT-4 324.47

Work Item

Documents :
S.No |Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c;Bn;ent Size
1 Tender Documents 2911_j.pdf 2911 i 346.76
2 Tender Documents Bar_Chart_SI5.pdf BAR CHART 57.16
3 BOQ BOQ_317478.xls BOQ 301.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sewcliwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH NAYANJYOTI GHOSH

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA
3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

EE-II, LDCD

Address

Office of the Executive Engineers Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By

ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation

EE

Created Date

19-Jun-2018 12:27 PM

19/06/2018 12:43 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

G
"% WESt Bengai Tender Details

AV

O] ienaers Date : 19-Jun-2018 12:44 PM
& Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain CE - NORTH WESTERN| |WESTERN CIRCLE - I (IRRI)||LD CONSTRUCTION DIVISION
Tender Reference
Number WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19
Tender ID 2018 CE2_177164 6
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency No
Allowed For Fee
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online  |[SNo [Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |/, ICICI BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT-4
/Technical
.pdf 2911 j
.pdf FORMS
.pdf BAR CHART
2 Finance Xls BOQ
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,

PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE

2 CERTIFICATES

GST Registration Certificate

GST Registration Certificate

3 COMPANY DETAILS

COMPANY DETAILS 1

PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
MOA, TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES
7 FINANCIAL INFO PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1 PAYMENT CERTIFICATE 1
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
8 FINANCIAL INFO 2015-16 2015-16
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
0 FINANCIAL INFO 2016-2017 2016-2017
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
10 FINANCIAL INFO 2017-18 2017-18
EMD Fee Details
EMD Amount in ¥ 87,869 EMD Exemption Allowed Yes
EMD Fee Type percentage |EMD Percentage 2.0%
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EMD Payable To

EE-II,
LDCD

https://whbtenders.gov.irVni cgep/app?component=3DirectLink& page=Publ ...

‘ EMD Payable At

ONLINE PAYMENT/ NEFT/

RTGS

Work /Item(s)

Title

WBIW/EE-II/LDCD/e-NIT-4/ 2018-19/ SL-6

Work Description

Protection work along the Right Embankment of Gaighata khal for a length of 135 m at village Bahir-Khalna in
G.P-Khalna, Block- Amta-II, P.S.-Joypur, Dist-Howrah

Pre Qualification
Details

Independent External |NA

Monitor

Tender Value in ¥ 43,93,440 Product Category CIVIL WORKS  |Sub category NA

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |60

Location Gaighata Khal |Pincode 711303 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place O/0O EE-II LDCD
Address

Critical Dates

Publish Date

19-Jun-2018 01:00 PM Bid Opening Date

03-Jul-2018 11:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Document Download / Sale End

Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

19-Jun-2018 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date

02-Jul-2018 05:30 PM

Tender D men

NIT .

Document S.No|Document Name Description I()i:cll(JBn;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT-4 324.47,

Work Item

Documents :
S.No |Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c;Bn;ent Size
1 Tender Documents 2911_j.pdf 2911 i 346.76

Tender Documents Bar_Chart_SI6.pdf BAR CHART 57.24

3 BOQ BOQ_317483.xls BOQ 301.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sewcliwd@gmail.com NAYANJYOTI GHOSH NAYANJYOTI GHOSH

2. jkdinda12@gmail.com JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA JAYANTA KUMAR DINDA
3. iamanirban73@yahoo.in ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

EE-II, LDCD

Address

Office of the Executive Engineers Lower Damodar Construction Division Fuleswar, Uluberia, Howrah-711316

Tender Creator Details

Created By

ANIRBAN BHATTACHARYA

Designation

EE

Created Date

19-Jun-2018 12:32 PM

19/06/2018 12:44 PM
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